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ABSTRACT 
 

The presented research depicts the narration 

and discourse of Bhinneka Tunggal Ika in the 

history subject. By using history didactic ap-

proach, this research focuses on two dimen-

sions of analysis: (1) the narration and dis-

course of the history textbook and (2) teachers’ 

interpretation as well as objectification to-

wards the discourse of Bhinneka Tunggal Ika in 

the history textbook. The Socio-cognitive dis-

course analysis was used as the research meth-

od and attitude. The corpus of analysis was 

the revised edition of the compulsory history 

textbook published by The Republic of Indo-

nesia’s Ministry of Education and Culture, 

and the research participants are 15 teachers of 

Senior High Schools in Surakarta. The re-

markable finding of this research is the une-

qual position between unity and diversity. This 

research exposes that the textbook posits the 

narration and discourse of unity above the 

sense of diversity. These narrations and dis-

course are confirmed by the most of research 

participants in which they tend to articulate 

the importance of unity and integration in 

their interpretation. Following this interpreta-

tion, the teachers’ objectification is postulated 

in some attitudes such as patriotic, mutual-

cooperation, and solidarity, led to the ideology 

of nationalism. The authors highlighted the 

unequal position between unity and diversity 

as the crucial problem in the textbook narra-

tion and discourse that, in certain degrees, 

could become a latent problem for the national 

integration, such as minority intolerance and 

annihilation. 

 

Keywords: Bhinneka Tunggal Ika, history text-

book, unity above diversity 

ABSTRAK 
 

Penelitian ini menggambarkan narasi dan 

wacana Bhinneka Tunggal Ika dalam mata 

pelajaran sejarah. Dengan menggunakan pen-

dekatan didaktik sejarah, penelitian ini ber-

fokus pada dua dimensi analisis: (1) narasi dan 

wacana buku teks sejarah dan (2) interpretasi 

guru serta objektifikasi terhadap wacana 

Bhinneka Tunggal Ika dalam buku teks se-

jarah. Analisis  wacana sosial -kognit if  

d igunakan sebagai  metode dan s ikap 

penelitian. Analisis teks menggunakan edisi 

revisi dari buku teks sejarah wajib yang diter-

bitkan oleh Kementerian Pendidikan dan Ke-

budayaan Republik Indonesia, dan peserta 

penelitian adalah 15 guru Sekolah Menengah 

Atas di Surakarta. Temuan dari penelitian ini 

adalah posisi yang tidak setara antara persatu-

an dan keanekaragaman. Penelitian ini 

mengungkap bahwa buku teks menempatkan 

narasi dan wacana persatuan di atas rasa 

keberagaman. Narasi dan wacana ini dikonfir-

masi oleh sebagian besar peserta penelitian di 

mana mereka cenderung mengartikulasikan 

pentingnya persatuan dan integrasi dalam in-

terpretasi mereka. Setelah interpretasi ini, ob-

jektifikasi guru dipostulatkan dalam beberapa 

sikap seperti patriotik, gotong royong, dan 

solidaritas, mengarah pada ideologi nasional-

isme. Para penulis menyoroti posisi yang tidak 

setara antara persatuan dan keragaman se-

bagai masalah krusial dalam narasi dan waca-

na buku teks yang, dalam derajat tertentu, bisa 

menjadi masalah laten bagi integrasi nasional, 

seperti intoleransi minoritas dan pemusnahan. 

 

Kata kunci: Bhinneka Tunggal Ika, buku teks 

sejarah, kesatuan di atas keanekaragaman 
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INTRODUCTION 
The problem of diversity and national in-
tegration has been spotted as an important 
issue of the Indonesian contemporary edu-
cation. This is proved by the foundation of 
Indonesian education that seems to up-
hold the sense of unity in diversity. The 
document of Curriculum 2013 articulates 
the awareness of diversity in the form of 
negotiation between local and national 
interests and the empowerment of unity in 
diversity that those are considered as the 
empirical foundations of the curriculum 
development. The curriculum uses the 
term Bhinneka Tunggal Ika to represent the 

unity and diversity and explicitly men-
tioned that this term coincidences with the 
democracy and multiculturalism. 

The curriculum situates the social 
science learning, specifically the history 
subject, as a device to impart the values of 
Bhinneka Tunggal Ika. The substance of 

Bhinneka Tunggal Ika is mentioned explicit-

ly in the core and basic competencies of 
the history curriculum that design the stu-
dents to “living with the values of unity 
and the willingness to unify in the struggle 
of the national movement towards the na-
tion independence as a gift from Almighty 
God to the nation and state of Indonesia”. 
This substance is then derived into the 
learning materials and the content of his-
tory textbooks that narrated the topic 
about Bhinneka Tunggal Ika, although it is 

only depicted explicitly in the description 
of several historical events.  

The designed curriculum and its 
learning material are facing challenges 
from the current political and social cir-
cumstances that displayed the escalation 
of intolerance. The PPIM’s survey of the 
Jakarta Islamic State University in 2017, 
which covered 1,800 education institu-
tions in 34 provinces, had shown the 
tendencies of intolerance among students 
in which 60 percent of the students were 
regarded to have had a radical religious 
attitudes (Mcbeth, 2018). Some of the ob-
servers believed that the current problems 
of intolerance in Indonesia are different 
from the past trends. Today, the problem 
of intolerance are not merely determined 

by ethnicity (Liddle, 1970; Schefold, 
1998), but it also appertains with the polit-
ico-religious fragmentation under the flow 
of global ideology movements (Saidi, 
2012; Sofjan, 2016). 

The curriculum and its learning ma-
terials are expected to be able to respond 
to those problems, particularly by cultivat-
ing the narration and discourse of Bhinne-

ka Tunggal Ika in the learning process. Alt-

hough the curriculum is able to provoke 
the discourse of Bhinneka Tunggal Ika in 

the learning process (Farisi, 2014), howev-
er, some researcher had indicated that the 
curriculum 2013 and its teaching materials 
are insufficient. Djalong (2017) had indi-
cated that the curriculum had failed in 
promoting the values of tolerance. By ana-
lyzing the content of Curriculum 2013, 
Djalong pointed out the indistinct direc-
tion of several fundamental issues on the 
relationship between tolerance, citizen-
ship, and cultural-religious diversity. 
Meanwhile, the finding of PPIM’s re-
search of Jakarta Islamic State University 
in 2017 had indicated that the teaching 
materials, specifically in Islamic textbooks 
published by the Ministry of Education 
and Culture, contained intolerant narra-
tion (Mcbeth, 2018). 

The authors believe that the prob-
lem of intolerance in Indonesian educa-
tion could not be simply assumed originat-
ed from the lack of textual dimension such 
as from the textbook narration. On the 
practical level, the textual narration can be 
diverted depending on the contextual di-
mension. Teachers and students are the 
active and independent subjects. They can 
reject, accept, or elaborate new infor-
mation. Through interaction, they collec-
tively interpret and object the discourse in 
the form of perception, argumentation, 
and opinion. It means, in the context of 
Bhinneka Tunggal Ika and intolerance, 

teachers and students are not merely or-
dered structurally by the documents. 
There is a space for diversion or prolifera-
tion of the discourse during the discourse 

processing. 
The study about diversion or prolif-

eration of the textbook narration is less 
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investigated by the textbook analysts. Re-
poussi and Tutiaux-Guillon (2010) point-
ed out that the study of the textbook is 
divided into two domains of analysis: crit-
ical and linguistic. In the critical research, 
the textbook analyst would focus their 
work on the critical content analysis of the 
textbooks related to the political dimen-
sion, power relation, and the making of 
knowledge (Haynor, Apple, & Christian-
Smith, 1991).  

This type of research is used com-
monly by the textbook analysts whose 
concern are to reveal the political dimen-
sion of the textbook, such as the study of 
politicization of the history textbook 
(Curaming, 2005), the military discourse 
and the construction of national identity 
(Purwanta, 2013, 2017), the ideology of 
nationalism and militarism (Mulyana, 
2013; Darmawan and Mulyana, 2017),the 
colonial discourse (Purwanta, 2018), and 
the analysis of the narrative logic of the 
textbook (Abidin, 2017).Those researches 
tend to perceive the textbook critically un-
der the political and power relation. Com-
monly, those researches pre-assume, with-
out any empirical elaboration or verifica-
tion, that the students would accept direct-
ly the textbook’s narration or discourse. 

In the type of linguistic research, the 
textbook analysts examined the quality of 
the textbooks in several criteria such as 
language, content, narrative structure, or 
the textbook argumentation (Repoussi & 
Tutiaux-Guillon, 2010).This type of re-
search is used commonly by the educator 
and the developer of history education 
whose aimed is to improve the feasibility 
and readability of the textbooks, such as 
the study of the content evaluation 
(Purwanta, 2012), the challenges of text-
book implementation (Darwati, 2011), the 
content evaluation of multiculturalism 
(Mulyana, 2017), and the development of 
history textbook based on the Indonesia-
centrism (Kurniawan, 2017). 

Considering those domains of anal-
ysis, the authors argue that the textbook 

should be contextualized in the education-
al environments. Consequently, the text-
book analysis should include the structural 

analysis and the practical analysis of the 
textbook. Therefore, the history didactic 
approach should be used as an approach 
to analyze narration, interpretation, and 
objectification of the textbook. Based on 
those theoretical backgrounds, this re-
search is aimed to reveal the narration of 
Bhinneka Tunggal Ika in the history text-

book. Moreover, the analysis is extended 
to the practical analysis of the narration, 
particularly in the teachers’ interpretation 

and objectification of the textbook narra-
tion.   

 

RESEARCH METHOD 
The critical discourse analysis with the 
socio-cognitive approach (van Dijk, 2015; 
van Dijk, 2017) was employed as the 
method and attitude of this research in 
order to reveal the narration, interpreta-
tion, and objectification of Bhinneka Tung-

gal Ika based on the analysis of the history 

textbook narration and the teachers’ dis-
course comprehension. The corpus of 
analysis was the revised edition of the 
compulsory textbook for the history sub-
ject published by the Republic of Indone-
sia’s Ministry of Education and Culture in 
2017. The analysis was focused on (1) the 
narration and discourse of Bhinneka Tung-

gal Ika in the history textbook, (2) the cog-

nitive interface and discursive practice that 
covered the analysis of the teachers’ inter-
pretation and objectification towards the 
textbook narration, and (3) the discourse 
comprehension analysis of the teachers 
that relate to the diversion and prolifera-
tion of narration. White’s (2009) frame-
work of discourse, narrative, and narrative
-discourse were used in this research. The 
authors assumed that, in a certain part, the 
textbook can be presented as a narration, 
and in other parts, it also can be a dis-
course or narrative-discourse. The repre-
sentative narrations were analyzed in tex-
tual level, which covered the grammatical 
and schematic analysis. The textual analy-
sis was then elaborated with the socio-
cognitive analysis that focuses on the 
teachers’ interpretation and objectifica-
tion, which employed the analysis of dis-
course processing, knowledge, and atti-
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tude and ideology of teachers. 
Considering the complex mecha-

nism of socio-cognitive analysis, the au-
thors decided to focus on the teachers’ 
perimeters. At least, from the teachers’ 
perimeters, this research would be able to 
trace the production or reproduction of 
Bhinneka Tunggal Ika narration and dis-

course. Based on this consideration, 15 
teachers of Senior High Schools in Sura-
karta had participated as the subject of 
research. From the authors’ point of view, 
those teachers are living in the same epis-
temic community in which they could rep-
resent the common interpretations and 
objectification of the teachers in Surakarta 
and, in a certain degree without any inten-
tion to generalize or simplify, the teachers 
in Indonesia. On the practical level, the 
teachers had an intermediary role in con-
trolling the narration by clarifying or veri-
fying the narration before it is accepted 
and interpreted by the students as the re-
cipient of the discourse. By looking at 
those frameworks, the authors interviewed 
teachers in regard to their interpretation 
and objectification of Bhinneka Tunggal 

Ika. The authors then analyzed the diver-

sion and proliferation of the narration for 
educational purposes, particularly as Van 
Dijk’s (1980) suggestion to improve the 
quality of textbook. 

 

RESULT AND DISCUSSION 

The Narration of Bhinneka Tunggal Ika 

The history textbook was constituted in 
popular regressive style. This style sets the 
students to examine the historical herit-
age. The regressive style is designed for 
the students to view the narration of 
Bhinneka Tunggal Ika by looking back from 

the present time to the particular historical 
event in the past. Through this style, the 
students are assumed being able to under-
stand the progress or regress of civilization 
from the ancient time until today. Conse-
quently, history textbook should be struc-
tured systematically. A preface is provided 
in each chapter to introduce the learning 
topic before the narration of the historical 
events. The preface is opened by a citation 
from the “scientific book” related to the 

learning topic and commonly, it is pre-
sented in a form of narration. In the first 
paragraph of the preface, the narration 
starts with the explanation of the particu-
lar contemporary problem. In the next 
paragraphs, the narrator discourses the 
topic and values of learning by elaborating 
and, in a certain degree, reflecting the pre-
sent problems with the depiction of the 
past. By this comparison, the narrator 
tried to reflect the values of the past, 

which then followed by the narration of 
historical events. 

The subject of Bhinneka Tunggal Ika 

is mentioned implicitly as one of the learn-
ing purposes of chapter 4. The chapter 
narrates the learning topic about “Sumpah 
P e m u d a  d a n  J a t i  D i r i  K e i n d o n e s i -

aan” [Youth Pledge and Indonesian iden-

tity]. The textbook, as the extension of 
Curriculum 2013, declared the historical 
narration, particularly in chapter 4, has 
one objective to “meningkatkan rasa syukur 
kepada Tuhan Yang Maha Esa atas karunia-
Nya yang memberikan dorongan bangsa Indo-
nesia untuk memperkukuh persatuan di atas 

keberagaman” [to feel more gratitude to the 

One Almighty God for His grace that en-
courages the nation of Indonesia to af-
firmed unity above diversity]. This learn-

ing objective exposes that the sense of 
Bhinneka Tunggal Ika which is represented 

in the form of “keberagaman” [diversity], 

w h i c h  i s  p o s i t e d  u n d e r  t h e 
“persatuan” [unity]. The description of the 

learning objective reflects a structure in 
which, in one side, the unity is preferred 
as an important aspect of the national in-
terest, and in another side, the unity is 
constructed from the diversity, thus conse-
quently, unity is located above the diversi-
ty. 

This structure constitutes the histori-
cal narration on the textbook. The first 
section of chapter 4 is about the back-
ground of Youth Pledge 1928. This chap-
ter emphasizes the role of the “youth” and 
“educated” people as the exponent of the 
Indonesian national awakening. The text-
book marked the Youth Pledge, 28 Octo-
ber 1928, as the important historical 
events that should be learned by the stu-
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dents to strengthen their unity and identi-
ty. The “youth” and “educated” people 
generated from the “western education” 
that evolved the national awareness 
among them. The textbook narrates that 
this “youth” and “educated” people were 
“… tidak memandang Jawa, Sunda, 
Minangkabau, Ambon, atau apa pun kare-
na mereka adalah bumiputera” [not view-
ing Javanese, Sundanese, Minangkabau, 
Ambonese and other because they are in-
digenous]. They were supported by the 
printed mass and the fusion of the mass 
organization, and the efforts hit the climax 
when the youth held Youth Congresses in 
1928. The textbook then leads the students 
to crystallize the important values of 
Youth Pledge: the value of unity as the 
primary; the values of self-determination, 
national identity, sovereignty, and nation-
alism; the value of democracy. 

If the narration is presented in the 
learning history, it will become a persua-
sive strategy. The narration persuades the 
students in identifying and categorizing 
themselves as the youth of educated peo-
ple. It is because the students naturally 
have similar characteristic with the depic-
tion of the youth and educated people. 
The students are young and are taught in 
formal education. Thus, theoretically, the 
narration would be effectively stimulated 
the norm and the values of the student by 
the reflection of the youth and education 
discourse. It means, in the practical level, 
the textbook had provided the narration 
and discourse of Bhinneka Tunggal Ika by 

the representation of youth and educated 
people that, theoretically, could be used 
by the teachers or students in the discur-
sive practice in the classroom. However, 
the textbook is less focused the narration 
on the socio-cultural diversity, thus, it 
could become the challenges for the teach-
ers. 

In sum, the textbook emphasizes the 
process of national integration without 
considering their socio-cultural differ-
ences. Thus, the narration does not refer 
to unity in diversity, but it is rather closely 
to unity above diversity. In addition, this 
kind of identification is associated with 

the nation identity of Indonesian people: 
one homeland, one nation, and one lan-
guage. The description of the learning ob-
jective reflects a structure in which, in one 
side, the unity is preferred as an important 
aspect in the national interest, and in other 
side, the unity is constructed from the di-
versity, thus as consequence, unity is lo-
cated above the diversity. Then, the narra-
tion and discourse of Bhinneka Tunggal Ika 

is disguised under the senses of unity. 

Meaning, it tends to be called unity above 
diversity. 

 

Teachers’ Interpretation and Objectifica-

tion  
Based on the interview, the authors 
summed up that the narration and dis-
course of Youth Pledge and nation identi-
ty are interpreted in the term of unity; 
even this topic of learning also contains 
the objective to acknowledge the diversity. 
This indicated that the teachers gave a 
privilege to the narration of unity in their 
interpretation and objectification. The 
privilege is represented in how the teach-
ers confirmed the importance of unity as 
well as, in certain degree, other narrations 
of the textbook such as the importance of 
youth and Youth Pledge, as the decisive 
factor that supports the struggle of nation-
al movement. The citation below can give 
a clear depiction of the privilege:  

Nilai utama yang dapat saya ambil setelah 

membaca materi tersebut ialah pentingnya 

semangat persatuan. Peristiwa Sumpah 

Pemuda dipandang sebagai pengakuan fun-

damental dari sebuah bangsa yang masih 

dalam tahap pembentukan. Para pemuda 

dengan memahami sejarah panjang per-

juangan bangsa Indonesia, telah melahirkan 

kesadaran yang mendalam tentang pent-

ingnya persatuan.Tanpa semangat persatu-

an mustahil bangsa Indonesia bias terlepas 

dari penjajahan bangsa asing. 

 
[The main value that I gathered after 

reading that material (narration) is 

regarding the importance of the unity 

spirit. The Youth Pledge was seen as a 

fundamental recognition of a nation in 

t h e  m a k i n g .  T h e  y o u t h s  b y 

understanding the long history of 

Indonesia’s struggle, have developed a 



 23 

Paramita: Historical Studies Journal, 29(1), 2019 

deep awareness of the importance of 

unity. Without the spirit of unity, it is 

impossible for the nation of Indonesia 

to be free from colonization] 

 
The citation above shows that the teachers 
posit the spirit of unity as the key values of 
the Youth Pledge narration. The teacher 
rewords the term ‘unity’ in three different 
sentences in order to present the values of 
unity in the past and present times. This 
mode of interpretation showed that the 
teachers tend to realize the importance 
and tried to reproduce the discourse of 
unity. In general, this citation represents 
the common mode of interpretation that 
had been used among teachers. In sum, 
the citation also reveals that the teachers 
accepted the textbook narration; therefore, 
the similar meaning between textbook nar-
ration and teachers’ interpretation oc-
curred that the unity is postulated above 
the diversity. 

This interpretation constructs the 

objectification of the teachers towards the 
textbook narration. The teachers’ objectifi-
cation is presented in the form of several 
attitudes such as patriotism, struggle, uni-
ty, nationalism, sovereignty, independ-
ence. The teachers mostly objected the 
narration into some terms like coopera-
tion, mutual respect, deliberation, as the 
representational attitude of unity.  Such 
attitudes coincided with the contextualiza-
tion of narration. The teachers tried to 
extend the discourse by contextualizing 
the topic of learning with the related prob-
lems in the present times such as the prob-
lem of disintegration, crisis of national 
identity, the escalation of radicalism and 
intolerance among the youth, poverty, and 
mental degradation. The citation below 
represents the teachers’ objectification: 

 
Nilai yang dapat saya sampaikan adalah 

nilai persatuan, nilai kemandirian, jati diri, 

kedaulatan atau penguatan nasionalisme, 

serta nilai demokrasi. Nilai-nilai tersebut 

saya relevansikan dengan nilai-nilai persatu-

an pada masa sekarang yang sedikit banyak 

mulai memudar.Selain itu saya relevansi-

kan dengan kehidupan sehari-hari, agar 

siswa dapat memahami dan mengaplikasi-

kan nilai-nilai tersebut di lingkungan sekitar 

mereka  

 
[The value that I delivered is the unity 

values, independent values, identity 

values, sovereignty or nationalism 

affirmation, also democracy values. 

Those values I put to relevance with the 

unity values in the present time, which 

have started to fade. Furthermore, I put 

to relevance with daily live activities, so 

that the students will  be able to 

understand and applied those values in 

their society.] 

 
Considering this citation, the authors for-
mulate that the teachers’ objectification 
was determined by the knowledge and 
their senses of the present problems. This 
process deploys complex mechanism be-
tween the teachers’ schemata, context, 
and the new information. 

This type of knowledge and attitude 
produces a marginalized term ethnic, lo-
cal, that considered as the failure of unity. 
They tried to seek a mode to express an 
oppositional term to outlines the disunity. 
The below citation represents this mode: 
“Terwujudnya sumpah pemuda juga berarti 
keberhasilan dalam meredam gejolak etnosen-
trisme yang sebelumnya merebak dalam corak 
perjuangan mengenyahkan eksistensi kolonial-

isme dan imperialisme” [The establishment 

of Youth Pledge also means success in 
diminishing ethnocentrism that previously 
blossomed inside the struggle of eradicat-
ing the existence of colonialism and impe-
rialism].  

Th e  t ea cher s  u se d  th e  wo rd 
“ethnocentrism” to represent the opposite 
of unity. In this degree of analysis, the 
knowledge and attitudes of teachers can 
be identified as the ideology of national-
ism. Based on those descriptions, the trace 
of teachers’ knowledge was led to the na-
tionalism and unity. By this mechanism, 
the nationalism tends to be the shareable 
knowledge during learning history. 

In addition, in this research cases, 
there is a linear line between the textbook 
narration and teachers’ interpretation and 
objectification, in which the presented dis-
course is the unity above diversity. This 
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indicates the knowledge and attitude of 
teachers that are in line with the textbook, 
of putting the unity above the diversity. 
The discourse of ethnocentrism is derived 
from the content of the textbook. It means 
the teachers tend to reproduce this term in 
their interpretation, and in certain degree, 
in their objectification. This attitude can 
determine the social identity in which the 
space for socio-cultural ethnic diversity is 
less considered in the term of unity above 
diversity. 

 

Unity above Diversity  
As the result of the teachers’ interpreta-
tion, the structured position of unity above 
diversity shows the dynamic transfor-
mation on the meaning of Bhinneka Tung-

gal Ika. Whether it is realized or not by the 

other researchers such as (Mulyana, 2013; 
Utami and Widiadi, 2016), it seems the 
structured position of unity above diversi-
ty are missed from their research range. 
Considering the teachers’ confirmation on 
the textbook discourse, the authors as-
sumed that the discourse of “unity above 
diversity” has rooted in the ideology of 
Indonesian people. The teachers’ confir-
mation reflects that they already had 
knowledge of unity above diversity. This 
mental condition could reflect the social 
structure of Indonesia society, since the 
education became an arena of production 
and reproduction of narration of Bhinneka 

Tunggal Ika (Suryadinata, 1988). 

From historical perspective, this 
structural position, which posits the dis-
course unity above diversity, could be 
traced as the transformation as well as the 
legacy of the early politicization of the 
discourse of Bhinneka Tunggal Ika. Histori-

cally, Bhinneka Tunggal Ika has rooted as a 

cognitive mode of nation integration. Soe-
karno had generated the term Bhinneka 

Tunggal Ika from the ancient manuscript 

of Majapahit Empire, Kakawin Sutasoma 

(Aoyama, 1986), and he used it precisely 
as the national myth (Fisher, 1967) to 
evokes the sense of active pluralism 
(Vatikiotis, 1998) during the political tur-
bulence in the Constitutional Democracy 
and later in the Guided Democracy eras 

(Herbert, 1962). 
In the following periods, this term 

was reproduced in the framework of New 
Order’s interpretation to create a politico-
economic stabilization through the dis-
course of harmony and unity (Carnegie, 
2010; Prawiradinata, 1988). This term had 
been posited as the cultural strategy 
(Jones, 2015), and in certain degree, as the 
integrative ideology  along with politico-
military repression (Weatherbee, 1981). 

After the fall of the New Order, the term is 
adopting continuously -even some intel-
lectuals such as Suparlan (2014) and 
Boellstorff (2014) has questioned it.  

The symptoms of unequal position 
of the unity above diversity had been indi-
cated by Pauker (1958) and Bemmelen 
and Raben's (2011) observations that since 
the 1950, the government had concerned 
with the unity that resulted in the impres-
siveness of national interests. As Heester-
man's (1986) argumentation, this unequal 
position brought paradox meaning to 
Bhinneka Tunggal Ika that in one hand the 

people should dispose to integrate in one 
nation but in the other hand, they also 
held their local identities and, in certain 
degree, local aspirations. No doubt, in 
some cases, this paradoxical meaning re-
sulted crucial problems in society. 

From this point of view, the authors 
postulate that there is a problem between 
nationalism and diversity, particularly to-
wards the presence of others in Indonesian 
society. As indicated by Sariyatun, 
Joebagio and Sumardjoko (2018), this 
condition can be worsened due to the mi-
nority intolerance problems in Indonesia’s  
education. The problem is that the une-
qual position between unity and diversity. 
This research shows the privilege of unity 
and, in a certain degree, the negative per-
ception towards the term ethnicity such as 
ethnocentrism. Consequently, about the 
minority problem in Indonesian educa-
tion, the narration of diversity is less pre-
sented in the textbook narration or in the 
classroom discourse. It means, using 
Salmi's (1993) framework, the discourse 
narrative and knowledge of ethnicity are 
annihilated. In this condition, the problem 
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of unity and diversity becomes more com-
plicated because of multiplicity frame-
works of the nation construction between 
unity and diversity as well as between eth-
nicities and religiosity (Meuleman, 2006). 

Those above analysis showed that 
the objective of Indonesian education is to 
evoke the culture of unity in diversity, by 
considering this research, has not reached 
the expectation. This research showed that 
the narration and discourse of unity had 
posited above the diversity. The privilege 
had been given to the narration of unity. 
This narration and discourse had been 
reproduced in the teachers’ interpretation 
and objectification. It possibly becomes a 
crucial problem for the future of Indone-
sian education that, as the impact of glob-
alization and migration, should be able to 
foster the students’ awareness of diversity. 
Thus, as Bazzi, Gaduh, Rothenberg, and 
Wong's (2018) framework, the authors 
believe that the textbook narration should 
depict the history of socio-religious diver-
sity and interactions of Indonesian society 
by using equal narration in each level of 
national integration.  

 

CONCLUSION 
Based on the findings of research, the au-
thors conclude that the history textbook 
narrated Bhinneka Tunggal Ika under the 

discourse of unity. The teachers seem to 
confirm and reproduce the narration and 
discourse of the textbook. Meanwhile, 
teachers’ objectification was affected by 
the teachers’ schemata, context, and the 
discourse practices. This mechanism of 
discourse comprehension from the narra-
tion and discourse of the textbook until 
the teachers’ interpretation and objectifica-
tion had resulting in the discourse of unity 
above diversity that is closely related to 
the ideology nationalism. The authors 
highlighted the unequal position between 
unity and diversity as the crucial problem 
in the textbook narration and discourse 
that, in certain degrees, could become a 
latent problem for the national integra-
tion, such as minority intolerance and an-
nihilation. 

These findings theoretically and 

practically implicate in both of the pre-
view of textbook analysis and the analysis 
of teachers’ discourse. By this research, 
the authors provoke other researchers to 
take a history didactic approach in analyz-
ing the narration or discourse of the text-
book. It is because the discourse in text-
book should be contextualized in its prac-
tical environment that is in the classroom 
in order to get a holistic understanding of 
the textbook and discourse mechanism in 

the classroom. Meanwhile, the govern-
ment should provide a plural narration as 
well as discourse in the textbook history 
that puts unity and diversity in an equal 
position to become unity in diversity. The 
plural narration can be provided by socio-
ecological approach that theoretically 
gives a space for the diversity narration 
from the localities. This research, of 
course, has a limitation in which the anal-
ysis did not touch dimension of students’ 
interpretation and objectification towards 
the textbook and teachers’ discourse. 
However, the research can become an 
alarm of unequal narration between unity 
and diversity that can be used as a recom-
mendation for the textbook improvement.  
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